Glauconite Road Base (3x5):	\$ NO BID	ton NO BID	yard
Glaucointe rock:	\$ NO BID	ton NO BID	yard
Limestone Base	\$ 36.00	ton NO BID	yard
Filter Rock (1"):	\$ 43.00	ton NO BID	yard
<u>Rip-Rap (3x5):</u>	\$ 46.75	ton ^{NO BIĎ}	yard
#4 Railroad Ballast (2")	\$ 45.00	ton NO BID	yard
Oil Sand Base (quick set)	\$ 71.00	ton NO BID	yard
Type D Hot Mix:	\$ 108.75	ton NO BID	yard
Precoated HMCL	\$ 112.75	ton NO BID	yard
HP Cold Mix	\$ 107.00	ton NO BID	yard

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL EMVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice.

Any and all bids shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.

DATE: 12/31/2022	FIRM:Texas Materials Group, Inc. dba Gulf Coast
NAME: Wayne Sweet	ADDRESS: P.O. Box 330, Jasper, Texas 75951
PHONE NUMBER: 409-384-4520	wayne.sweet@gc-texas.com

Bidder Initial

Vol _____ Page 555

COUNTY OF SABINE

Sabine, Texas

Bid Notice

In accordance with Vernons Texas Codes Annotated, Local Government Code, Chapter 262.025, the Commissioners Court of Sabine County, Texas will receive sealed bids on the following item(s) for use by Sabine County:

Road material

ALL SEALED BIDS MUST BE CLEARLY MARKED: Road Material

Bids will be received at the office of County Judge & Commissioners, 201 Main Street, or P.O. Box 716, Hemphill, Texas 75948 until Monday, December 16, 2022 at 3:00 p.m. Bids will be opened during a regular session of Sabine County Commissioners Court on December 29, 2022. Contracts awarded to the successful bidders in accordance with the above-mentioned chapter of the Local Government Code and will be VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023. Payment will be made by check after receiving the products or services provided to the County and upon approval of the invoices or statements by the Commissioners Court.

Please contact County Judge and Commissioner's office, at 409-787-3543, if you have any questions regarding the bid procedure.

Sabine County Reporter

Run 2X 11/30, 12/7

Vol ____ Page 556

$\frac{\text{Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5)}}{\text{Glauconite rock}}$ $\frac{(2 \times 4)}{(2 \times 4)}$ $\frac{R_{1}P}{R_{2}P}$		$\frac{16^{50}}{10^{50}} \frac{ton}{ton}$	N/A N/A N/A	vard vard vard
Limestone Base :	<u>\$</u>	ton		yard
Filter Rock (2 x 4):	<u>\$</u>	ton		yard
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6)</u> :	<u>\$</u>	ton		yard
·:	<u>\$</u>	ton		yard
	<u>\$</u>	ton		yard

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

<u>Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice.</u>

Any and all bids shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.

DATE: 12-9-22 FIRM: Jack ALEXANDER LTD. NAME: Rawby Alexander Address: P.O. Box 150338 LufKin, Tx 75915 PHONE NUMBER 936-632-3634

Bidder Initial

Vol _____ Page _557

COUNTY OF SABINE

Sabine, Texas

Bid Notice

In accordance with Vernons Texas Codes Annotated, Local Government Code, Chapter 262.025, the Commissioners Court of Sabine County, Texas will receive sealed bids on the following item(s) for use by Sabine County:

Road material

ALL SEALED BIDS MUST BE CLEARLY MARKED: Road Material

Bids will be received at the office of County Judge & Commissioners, 201 Main Street, or P.O. Box 716, Hemphill, Texas 75948 until Monday, December 16, 2022 at 3:00 p.m. Bids will be opened during a regular session of Sabine County Commissioners Court on December 29, 2022. Contracts awarded to the successful bidders in accordance with the above-mentioned chapter of the Local Government Code and will be VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023. Payment will be made by check after receiving the products or services provided to the County and upon approval of the invoices or statements by the Commissioners Court.

Please contact County Judge and Commissioner's office, at 409-787-3543, if you have any questions regarding the bid procedure.

Sabine County Reporter

Run 2X 11/30, 12/7

Vol _____ Page_<u>558</u>

<u>Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5)</u> :	\$ 16.50	ton \$16,50	vard
<u>Glauconite rock_</u> :	<u>\$</u>	ton	vard
Road Base:	\$ 10.00	ton \$ 12.00	vard
Limestone Base :	\$ NA	ton NA	vard
Filter Rock (2 x 4):	\$16.50	ton #16.50	yard
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6)</u> :	\$ 18.50	ton \$18.50	vard
:	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard
:	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice.

Any and all bids shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.

DATE: 11 29 22	FIRM: Big 4. Inc.
NAME: Melissa Meber Munguia	ADDRESS: 301 Worth Street
PHONE NUMBER: 409-187-2733	Hemphill, TX 75948

Bidder Initial

Vol ____ Page _____

COUNTY OF SABINE

Sabine, Texas

Bid Notice

In accordance with Vernons Texas Codes Annotated, Local Government Code, Chapter 262.025, the Commissioners Court of Sabine County, Texas will receive sealed bids on the following item(s) for use by Sabine County:

• Road material

ALL SEALED BIDS MUST BE CLEARLY MARKED: Road Material

Bids will be received at the office of County Judge & Commissioners, 201 Main Street, or P.O. Box 716, Hemphill, Texas 75948 until Monday, December 16, 2022 at 3:00 p.m. Bids will be opened during a regular session of Sabine County Commissioners Court on December 29, 2022. Contracts awarded to the successful bidders in accordance with the above-mentioned chapter of the Local Government Code and will be VALID THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2023. Payment will be made by check after receiving the products or services provided to the County and upon approval of the invoices or statements by the Commissioners Court.

Please contact County Judge and Commissioner's office, at 409-787-3543, if you have any questions regarding the bid procedure.

Sabine County Reporter

Run 2X 11/30, 12/7

Vol _____ Page<u>560</u>

Glauconite Road Base ():	<u>\$</u>	10.50 ton	yard
Glauconite rock : 345	\$	16.50 ton	yard
: 2×4	<u>\$</u>	16-50 ton	yard
5X8		16.50	
Limestone Base_:	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard
Filter Rock (2 x 4):	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6)</u> :	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard
:	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard
:	<u>\$</u>	ton	yard

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGUALATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice.

Any and all bids shall be provided on this sheet.

Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.

DATE: 12-14-22 FIRM: AttoyAc Rock, LLC NAME: Robert Birdwell ADDRESS: 1450 Eddings have S.A. TX. PHONE NUMBER: 936-275-6034

Bidder Initial

Vol Y Page 56/



Glauconite Base	\$10.50
2" Filtered	\$16.50
2x4 Filtered	\$16.50
3x5 Filtered	\$16.50
5x8 Filtered	\$16.50

Vol ____ Page_<u>5763</u>

1450 Eddings Lane

. .

San Augustine, TX 75972

936-275-3636